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Proper Citation

National Institute on Disability and Rehabilitation Research (RRID:SCR_012858)

Resource Information

URL: http://www2.ed.gov/about/offices/list/osers/nidrr/index.html

Proper Citation: National Institute on Disability and Rehabilitation Research 
(RRID:SCR_012858)

Description: Created in 1978, The National Institute on Disability and Rehabilitation 
Research (NIDRR) is a national leader in sponsoring research. We provide leadership and 
support for a comprehensive program of research related to the rehabilitation of individuals 
with disabilities. All of our programmatic efforts are aimed at improving the lives of individuals 
with disabilities from birth through adulthood. NIDRR is located in Washington, D.C., and is 
one of three components of the Office of Special Education and Rehabilitative Services 
(OSERS) at the U.S. Department of Education. NIDRR operates in concert with the 
Rehabilitation Services Administration (RSA) and the Office of Special Education Programs 
(OSEP). The mission of NIDRR is to generate new knowledge and promote its effective use 
to improve the abilities of people with disabilities to perform activities of their choice in the 
community, and also to expand society''s capacity to provide full opportunities and 
accommodations for its citizens with disabilities. Toward this end, NIDRR conducts 
comprehensive and coordinated programs of research and related activities to maximize the 
full inclusion, social integration, employment and independent living of individuals of all ages 
with disabilities. NIDRR''s focus includes research in areas such as employment; health and 
function; technology for access and function; independent living and community integration; 
and other associated disability research areas. Balanced between the scientific and 
consumer communities, NIDRR plays a unique role in federally-funded research activities. 
As part of the scientific community, NIDRR makes an important contribution to the overall 
knowledge in rehabilitation medicine, engineering, psychosocial rehabilitation, integration, 
vocational outcomes and the virtual and built environments. In addition, NIDRR''s work helps 
to integrate disability research into our nation''s policies regarding science and technology, 
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health care, and economics.

Abbreviations: NIDRR

Resource Type: government granting agency

Funding:

Resource Name: National Institute on Disability and Rehabilitation Research

Resource ID: SCR_012858

Alternate IDs: nlx_143870

Record Creation Time: 20220129T080312+0000

Record Last Update: 20250420T014622+0000

Ratings and Alerts

No rating or validation information has been found for National Institute on Disability and 
Rehabilitation Research.

No alerts have been found for National Institute on Disability and Rehabilitation Research.

Data and Source Information

Source:  SciCrunch Registry 

Usage and Citation Metrics

We have not found any literature mentions for this resource.
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